
BID TABULATION
Tandem Axle Loaders

Bid #PUR0417-208

May 15, 2017 at 3:00pm

Cedar Rapids 

Truck Center, 

Inc.

Harrison Truck 

Centers

Thompson 

Truck & Trailer

(Bid 1 of 2)

Thompson 

Truck & Trailer

(Bid 2 of 2)

Truck Country

(Bid 1 of 2)

Truck Country

(Bid 2 of 2)

Twin Bridges 

Truck City

Westman 

Freightliner/H

arrison Truck 

Center

Cedar Rapids, 

IA

Elk Run 

Heights, IA

Cedar Rapids, 

IA

Cedar Rapids, 

IA

Cedar Rapids, 

IA

Cedar Rapids, 

IA
Davenport, IA Marshall, NM

Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes No No

Line Item Description

Tandem Axle Side Loader - Garbage Waste 

(1) $307,713.00 no bid no bid no bid $332,883.00 no bid $325,392.00 no bid

Notes:

Truck bid 

submitted as 

21' bridge, if 

changed to 23' 

bridge add 

$1,230

Set-up for 23' 

bridge with 

roughly 20" gap 

$1,230

Cab and Chassis Manufacturer/Model Peterbilt 520 Autocar ACX64 Mack LR 613

Is chassis dealer authorized to sell, warrant, 

and service equipment? Yes Yes Yes

Is side loader manufactured by Labrie Yes Yes Yes

Is body dealer authorized to sell, warrant, 

and service equipment Yes Yes Yes

Estimated delivery 210-250 days 200 days 230 days

Tandem Axle Side Loader - Recycle (2) Unit 

Price $333,201.00 no bid no bid no bid $358,371.00 no bid $350,854.00 no bid

Extended Price $666,402.00 $716,742.00 $701,708.00

Notes:

Truck bid 

submitted as 

21' bridge, if 

changed to 23' 

bridge add 

$1,230 per 

truck

1) Set-up for 

23' bridge with 

roughly 20" gap 

$1,230

2) Best legal 

payload for 

recycling truck 

is 33CUYD. IF 

City wants 

33CUYD in lieu 

of 29CUYD will 

provide at no 

additional cost

VENDORS

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Vendor Location
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VENDORS

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Vendor Location

Cab and Chassis Manufacturer/Model Peterbilt 520 Autocar ACX64 Mack LR 613

Is chassis dealer authorized to sell, warrant, 

and service equipment? Yes Yes Yes

Is side loader manufactured by Labrie Yes Yes Yes

Is body dealer authorized to sell, warrant, 

and service equipment Yes Yes Yes

Estimated delivery 210-250 days 200 days 230 days

Tandem Axle Rear Loader (1) $201,383.00 $169,130.00 $201,476.00 $203,707.00 $188,973.00 $191,204.00 $202,254.00 $168,687.00

Notes:

Cab and Chassis Manufacturer/Model Peterbilt 348

Freightliner M2-

106

International 

7500

International 

7500

Freightliner 

M2106

Freightliner 

M2106 Mack GU 533

Freightliner 

M2106

Is chassis dealer authorized to sell, warrant, 

and service equipment? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Rear Loader Manufacturer/Model

NewWay 

Magnum

Loadmaster 

Excel S Leach 2RIII

NewWay 

Magnum Leach 2RIII

NewWay 

Magnum Leach 2RIII

Wayne 

Engineering-

Phoenix

Is body dealer authorized to sell, warrant, 

and service equipment Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Estimated delivery

Approx 200 

days 200-220 days 180 days 180 days 250 days 250 days 220 days 150 days

Signature Page

1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment? No No No No No No No No

2 Quick Pay Discount N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard? No No No No N/A N/A No No


